

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2020)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 8, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

		Tenoch Distribution, LLC 6740 Low Bid Lane #2 San Antonio, TX 78250	Act Pipe and Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	Fortiline 3011 North Pan Am Expy San Antonio, TX 78219	Ferguson Enterprises, LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill San Antonio, TX 78219	Core & Main LP 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	
Group 1	Pipe Restraining System for PVC Bell & Spigot Joints						
1.	5 ea. (SAWS #15266) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 28.90 TOTAL 144.50	50.54 252.70	37.84 189.20	30.48 152.40	33.59 167.95	
2.	70 ea. (SAWS #15262) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 36.96 TOTAL 2,587.20	74.67 5,226.90	45.55 3,188.50	38.96 2,727.20	42.93 3,005.10	
3.	100 ea. (SAWS #15263) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 61.89 TOTAL 6,189.00	93.48 9,348.00	67.08 6,708.00	65.25 6,525.00	71.90 7,190.00	
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #15260) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 104.17 TOTAL 520.85	159.99 799.95	118.62 593.10	113.39 566.95	134.05 670.25	
5.	75 ea. (SAWS #15242) Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 117.74 TOTAL 8,830.50	171.96 12,897.00	127.70 9,577.50	124.12 9,309.00	136.77 10,257.75	
6.	15 ea. (SAWS #15261) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 256.00 TOTAL 3,840.00	397.12 5,956.80	323.15 4,847.25	287.86 4,317.90	317.20 4,758.00	
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #32427) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 462.45 TOTAL 2,312.25	594.05 2,970.25	548.94 2,744.70	503.36 2,516.80	554.67 2,773.35	
8.	25 ea. (SAWS #15244) Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 24" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE 688.01 TOTAL 17,200.25	719.42 17,985.50	676.65 16,916.25	741.68 18,542.00	817.28 20,432.00	
	GROUP 1 TOTAL	TOTAL 41,624.55	55,437.10	44,764.50	44,657.25	49,254.40	
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Ford 1390-C-RB-1 Tyler Union 3000 Series	EBAA 1500	Ford UFR1390-C-RB-I	Sigma PWPE-C	Star SIP
Group 2	Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Bell & Spigot Joints						
1.	5 ea. (SAWS #30161) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 36.30 TOTAL 181.50	50.54 252.70	37.84 189.20	66.02 330.10	33.59 167.95	
2.	25 ea. (SAWS #30162) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 43.71 TOTAL 1,092.75	74.67 1,866.75	45.55 1,138.75	96.24 2,406.00	42.93 1,073.25	
3.	25 ea. (SAWS #30163) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 64.35 TOTAL 1,608.75	93.48 2,337.00	67.08 1,677.00	110.59 2,764.75	71.90 1,797.50	
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #30164) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 113.80 TOTAL 569.00	159.99 799.95	118.62 593.10	173.62 868.10	124.95 624.75	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2020)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 8, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			Tenoch Distribution, LLC 6740 Low Bid Lane #2 San Antonio, TX 78250	Act Pipe and Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	Fortiline 3011 North Pan Am Expy San Antonio, TX 78219	Ferguson Enterprises, LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill San Antonio, TX 78219	Core & Main LP 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233
5.	25 ea. (SAWS #30165) Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	122.53 3,063.25	171.96 4,299.00	127.70 3,192.50	206.93 5,173.25	136.77 3,419.25
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #30166) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	519.26 2,596.30	384.56 1,922.80	541.21 2,706.05	353.63 1,768.15	682.47 3,412.35
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #32428) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	790.88 3,954.40	582.44 2,912.20	826.85 4,134.25	633.46 3,167.30	237.90 1,189.50
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #30168) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 24" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	979.49 4,897.45	745.81 3,729.05	1,024.04 5,120.20	724.46 3,622.30	817.28 4,086.40
	GROUP 2 TOTAL	TOTAL	17,963.40	18,119.45	18,751.05	20,099.95	15,770.95
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Ford 1390-C-RB-1 Series	EBAA 1500	Ford UFR1390-C-RB-I UFR 1490-D-RB-I	Sigma SLDEH-X	SIP Star
	GROUP 3 Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for PVC Pipe						
1.	20 ea. (SAWS #15265) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	17.86 357.20	23.91 478.20	18.61 372.20	20.22 404.40	17.26 345.20
2.	500 ea. (SAWS #15255) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	24.41 12,205.00	28.99 14,495.00	25.44 12,720.00	24.56 12,280.00	20.97 10,485.00
3.	250 ea. (SAWS #15257) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	36.09 9,022.50	42.90 10,725.00	37.62 9,405.00	36.32 9,080.00	31.02 7,755.00
4.	10 ea. (SAWS #15246) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	60.63 606.30	81.12 811.20	63.20 632.00	68.63 686.30	58.60 586.00
5.	150 ea. (SAWS #15248) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	63.85 9,577.50	85.25 12,787.50	66.56 9,984.00	72.26 10,839.00	61.71 9,256.50
6.	50 ea. (SAWS #15250) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	141.63 7,081.50	182.49 9,124.50	147.62 7,381.00	160.28 8,014.00	136.87 6,843.50
7.	10 ea. (SAWS #45452) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	217.15 2,171.50	280.62 2,806.20	227.02 2,270.20	246.50 2,465.00	237.68 2,376.80
8.	20 ea. (SAWS 15258) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	282.14 5,642.80	323.87 6,477.40	294.97 5,899.40	284.68 5,693.60	274.49 5,489.80
	GROUP 3 TOTAL	TOTAL	46,664.30	57,705.00	48,663.80	49,462.30	43,137.80
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Ford 1500 Series Tyler Union 1500 Series	EBAA 2000PV	Ford UFR1500-C-I	Sigma SLCE-X	SIP Star

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2020)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 8, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

		Tenoch Distribution, LLC 6740 Low Bid Lane #2 San Antonio, TX 78250	Act Pipe and Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	Fortiline 3011 North Pan Am Expy San Antonio, TX 78219	Ferguson Enterprises, LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill San Antonio, TX 78219	Core & Main LP 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233
GROUP 4	Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe					
1.	20 ea. (SAWS #15253) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 14.74 TOTAL 294.80	19.48 389.60	15.08 301.60	16.69 333.80	14.26 285.20
2.	150 ea. (SAWS #15254) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 17.34 TOTAL 2,601.00	22.92 3,438.00	17.74 2,661.00	19.63 2,944.50	16.76 2,514.00
3.	80 ea. (SAWS #15256) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 26.06 TOTAL 2,084.80	34.99 2,799.20	26.65 2,132.00	29.49 2,359.20	25.19 2,015.20
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #30172) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 38.63 TOTAL 193.15	51.80 259.00	39.51 197.55	43.72 218.60	37.34 186.70
5.	40 ea. (SAWS #15247) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 56.27 TOTAL 2,250.80	75.35 3,014.00	57.56 2,302.40	63.68 2,547.20	54.39 2,175.60
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #15249) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 106.59 TOTAL 532.95	137.44 687.20	109.03 545.15	120.64 603.20	103.03 515.15
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #15251) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 186.95 TOTAL 934.75	241.43 1,207.15	191.81 959.05	212.24 1,061.20	181.25 906.25
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #15252) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for DI	UNIT PRICE 259.59 TOTAL 1,297.95	335.27 1,676.35	266.33 1,331.65	294.69 1,473.45	251.66 1,258.30
	GROUP 4 TOTAL	TOTAL 10,190.20	13,470.50	10,430.40	11,541.15	* 9,856.40
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No. Ford 1400 Series Tyler Union 1000 Series	EBAA 110400 Megalug	Star SGDPSON SBOND SGRIP Series 3000	Sigma SLDE-X	SIP Star
GROUP 5	Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for PVC Pipe to Mechanical Joint Fittings					
1.	20 ea. (SAWS #30174) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	49.74 994.80
2.	20 ea. (SAWS #30175) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	76.15 1,523.00
3.	15 ea. (SAWS #15259) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	166.10 2,491.50
	GROUP 5 TOTAL	TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	* 5,009.30
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.				Romac

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2020)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 8, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			Tenoch Distribution, LLC 6740 Low Bid Lane #2 San Antonio, TX 78250	Act Pipe and Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	Fortiline 3011 North Pan Am Expy San Antonio, TX 78219	Ferguson Enterprises, LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill San Antonio, TX 78219	Core & Main LP 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	
GROUP 6	Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Pipe to Mechanical Joint Fittings							
1.	100 ea. (SAWS #30176) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	49.74 4,974.00	
2.	20 ea. (SAWS #30177) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	76.15 1,523.00	
3.	15 ea. (SAWS #30178) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	166.10 2,491.50	
	GROUP 6 TOTAL	TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	8,988.50	
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.					Romac	
GROUP 7	Accessory Sets							
1.	150 ea. (SAWS #9062) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 4", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	13.86 2,079.00	15.67 2,350.50	15.75 2,362.50	14.67 2,200.50	12.53 1,879.50	
2.	1,500 ea. (SAWS #9063) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 6", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	16.49 24,735.00	21.78 32,670.00	17.08 25,620.00	20.17 30,255.00	17.23 25,845.00	
3.	400 ea. (SAWS #9064) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 8", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	16.49 6,596.00	23.68 9,472.00	17.87 7,148.00	20.17 8,068.00	17.23 6,892.00	
4.	50 ea. (SAWS #9058) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 10", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	18.80 940.00	31.12 1,556.00	23.73 1,186.50	26.77 1,338.50	22.86 1,143.00	
5.	150 ea. (SAWS #9059) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 12", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20.79 3,118.50	32.05 4,807.50	25.18 3,777.00	28.60 4,290.00	24.43 3,664.50	
6.	150 ea. (SAWS #9060) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 16", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	27.35 4,102.50	51.53 7,729.50	40.80 6,120.00	50.60 7,590.00	43.22 6,483.00	
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #15891) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 20", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	28.24 141.20	60.20 301.00	52.48 262.40	136.40 682.00	49.79 248.95	
8.	30 ea. (SAWS #9061) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 24", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	34.79 1,043.70	72.49 2,174.70	71.86 2,155.80	165.71 4,971.30	70.77 2,123.10	
	GROUP 7 TOTAL	TOTAL	42,755.90	61,061.20	48,632.20	59,395.30	48,279.05	
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Ford, Tyler Union, Accucast	EBAA 9006ECY	Ford MJAK-BNN-I	Sigma MGB	SIP Star	
	TOTAL GROUP AWARD		84,380.45				82,762.95	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & DATE: (Date of Award through May 31, 2020)
 3:00 p.m., July 8, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	Tenoch Distribution, LLC 6740 Low Bid Lane #2 San Antonio, TX 78250	Act Pipe and Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	Fortiline 3011 North Pan Am Expy San Antonio, TX 78219	Ferguson Enterprises, LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill San Antonio, TX 78219	Core & Main LP 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233
	EXTENSION 1	84,380.45				82,762.95
	EXTENSION 2	84,380.45				82,762.95
	EXTENSION 3	84,380.45				82,762.95
	EXTENSION 4	84,380.45				82,762.95
	Terms	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days
	Delivery Days					

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe and Supply
 AY McDonald
 Cohen Industrial Supply
 Core and Main
 Corix Water Products
 Ferguson Waterworks
 Fortiline

Gajeske
 Hydro Solution
 Iconix
 KLP Commercial
 Milford Online
 Tenoch Dist.

Demandstar
 SAWS Website